Project Completion Check List

| Lo THEA
Country Office:PAHRAIN Project/Output No. D053 5D / 5pD TSR]
obb 7543L

| confirm that all of the following matters have been considered and resolved:

No outstanding NEX advances ~ in either local currency or USD

No outstanding PDRs

No open Purchase Orders

No Receipt Accruals

No outstanding commitments

No pending prepayments and other non PO advances

All pre-financing activities have been recovered and/for reimbursed

No pending GMS or Direct Project Charging (formerly ISS). {If Off-the-top GMS was
used, extra-budgetary income taken must be reconciled to actual expenses/delivery. A
pro-rata return of GMS based on the balance of unspent funds must be done.)

No pending GLJEs

Noe unapplied deposits or other unrecorded revenue

No outstanding Accounts Receivable to be received from donors per signed agreements

No AR direct journals in budget error or incomplete status

All assets are transferred or otherwise disposed of. Asset transfer letters/ documents are
in place

Ensure all transactions for sale/transfer/donation/disposal etc. of assets have been
processed and GMS charged

All items held as inventory should be distributed or transferred to recipient or returned to
donor as specified in the donor agreement

All project petty cash is cleared

Project bank account is fully reconciled and closed

All accrued employee benefits are fully accounted

No other pending liabilities

The CDR for the previous quarter shows zero future expenses (commitments).

Final LPAC/ steering committee minutes are available

All audit observations are closed with supporting documentation.

The final CDR is signed by UNDP and the Implementing Partner. Final report submitted
by responsible parties.
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If a cost sharing project, the unexpended balance has been agreed to the general ledger.




Consultations with donors on the disposition of unexpended cost sharing balances,
where required by the contribution agreement, have taken place and are documented in
writing.

Donors) and the project balance is zero.

Notified Treasury Contributions Unit if the donor agreement requires interest to be
refunded to the donor if specified in the agreement.

l/ All refunds to donors have been transferred to Account 21030 (Pending Refunds to
/

Notified the GSSC to close any associated contract in the contracts module.

\/ All donor reports, as established in the Cost Sharing agreement, were submitted and
acknowledged receipt by the donor representative.
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The check list must be signed by the Resident Representative/Head of Office or a senior official
designated by the Resident Representative/Head of Office.

gt‘f&ar:m AL Shpa i)
Pepceate RS T

-




Olivia Murzello

e ;.

From: Shalet Pais

Sent: Tuesday, February 19, 2019 3:02 PM
To: Olivia Murzello

Subject: Project Id: 00059750 - GEEG
Attachments: unprores_60241704 PDF

Dear Qlivia,

Please find attached a copy of the Project Resources Overview report for the above-mentioned project. There is a small
discrepancy in the amount which is $3/-.

Kindly create a GLJE to correct the discrepancy so that we can operationally and financially close the project.

Thanks
Shalet






Olivia Murzello
L

From: Shalet Pais

Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2019 3:03 PM

To: Olivia Murzello

Subject: FW: Inquiries on the status of Awards (projects) in Atlas

Attachments: Output from UNPRORES (#60191723); Qutput from UNPRORES (#60191256)
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Due By: Sunday, February 17, 2019 11:30 AM

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Qlivia,

As per below e-mail request, kindly transfer the remaining resources of $156/- as per the attached project Resources
Overview Report for project ID: Award ID: 00044337 — UNICEF Funds for Moving as we need to close the project in
ATLAS.

We also need to close Award ID: 00063956 — Development Effectiveness in ATLAS.

Thanks
Shalet

From: Olinda CAYCHO
Sent: Wednesday, February 13, 2019 9:35 AM

To: Shalet Pais <shalet.pais@undp.org>
Cc: Stefano PETTINATO <stefano.pettinato@undp.org>

Subject: Re: Inquiries on the status of Awards (projects) in Atlas

Dear Shalet,

Thank you for your responses. Please, see my comments below in purple.
Best regards,

Clinda

From: Shalet Pais <shalet.pais@undp.org>
Date: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 at 3:09 PM

To: Olinda CAYCHO <olinda.caycho@undp.org>
Cc: Stefano PETTINATO <stefano.pettinato@undp.org>
Subject: FW: inquiries on the status of Awards (projects) in Atlas

Dear Olinda,
| have incorporated responses to your queries in green. Please see below.

Thanks



Shalet

From: Olinda CAYCHO

Sent: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 11:36 AM

To: Shalet Pais <shalet.pais@undp.org>

Subject: FW: Inquiries on the status of Awards {projects) in Atlas

Dear Shalet, sending the right query, apologies.

From: Olinda CAYCHO <olinda.caycho@undp.org>
Date: Monday, February 11, 2019 at 10:27 PM
To: Shalet Pais <shalet.pais@undp.org>

Subject: Inquiries on the status of Awards (projects} in Atlas

Dear Shalet,

Not sure if you are the right person to ask, please let me know if | need to redirect the below questions to someone else.
Thank you!

I'd appreciate to provide clarifications on the below situations:

- 2 Projects (outputs) #s 10012 and 112162, highlighted in blue in the attachment, do not have award (project)
number in Atlas —

Thank you. This is noted.

- 2 awards (projects) operationally closed, highlighted in orange in the attachment, that are still open. One of
them was closed for more than 12 months. —-

Noted. Please, update when transfer of the balance is done.

- Award (project) 59750, including 3 outputs, with end date in December 2017 is still with ‘active’ status in Atlas. -

Noted. Please, update when projects are closed.

Award (project) 60062 with end date 30 June 2018, did not have activities since 2017 and still with “active”
status in Atlas. What is the current status of the project? —

Can you please share the letter to the IP?



Award (project) 80256 with end date 31 Dec 2019, however it didn’t have any activity in 2018. What is the

current status of the project? — [

Noted. Can you please, share the project AWP for 2019?

Award (project) 66219 with end date in June 2019 but with no activites since 2017. Update on its status.

Can you please share the detail of the remaining balance of this project?

- Award (project) 79015 ‘UNCT Workplan 2014&2015’. What will be the decision on this project after the
delinking?

Noted with thanks.

Best regards,

Olinda
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Olivia Murzelio
“‘m

From: Shalet Pais

Sent: Tuesday, February 19, 2019 3.02 PM
To: Otlivia Murzello

Subject: Project Id: 00059750 - GEEG
Attachments: unprores_t0241704.PDF

Dear Olivia,

Please find attached a copy of the Project Resources Overview report for the above-mentioned project. There is a small
discrepancy in the amount which is $3/-.

Kindly create a GLJE to correct the discrepancy so that we can operationally and financially close the project.

Thanks
Shalet
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Olivia Murzelio
m

From: Shalet Pais

Sent: Thursday, February 14, 2019 3:03 PM

To: Olivia Murzello

Subject: FW: Inquiries on the status of Awards (projects) in Atlas

Attachments: Output from UNPRORES (#60191723); Cutput from UNPRORES (#60191256)
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Due By: Sunday, February 17, 2019 11:30 AM

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Olivia,

As per below e-mail request, kindly transfer the remaining resources of $156/- as per the attached project Resources

Overview Report for project ID: Award [D: 00044337 — UNICEF Funds for Moving as we need to close the project in
ATLAS.

We also need to close Award ID: 00063956 — Development Effectiveness in ATLAS.

Thanks
Shalet

From: Olinda CAYCHO

Sent: Wednesday, February 13, 2019 9:35 AM

To: Shalet Pais <shalet.pais@undp.org>

Cc: Stefano PETTINATO <stefano.pettinato@undp.org>
Subject: Re: Inquiries on the status of Awards {projects) in Atlas

Dear Shalet,

Thank you for your responses. Please, see my comments below in purple,
Best regards,

Otlinda

From: Shalet Pais <shalet.pais@undp.org>

Date: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 at 3:09 PM

To: Olinda CAYCHO <olinda.caycho@undp.org>

Cc: Stefano PETTINATO <stefano.pettinato@undp.org>

Subject: FW: Inquiries on the status of Awards {projects) in Atlas

Dear Qlinda,

| have incorporated responses to your queries in green. Please see below.

Thanks



Shalet

From: Olinda CAYCHO

Sent: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 11:36 AM

To: Shalet Pais <shalet.pais@undp.org>

Subject: FW: Inquiries on the status of Awards (projects) in Atlas

Dear Shalet, sending the right query, apologies.

From: Olinda CAYCHO <olinda.caycho@undp.org>

Date: Monday, February 11, 2019 at 10:27 PM

To: Shalet Pais <shalet.pais@undp.org>

Subject: Inquiries on the status of Awards {projects) in Atlas

Dear Shalet,

Not sure if you are the right person to ask, please let me know if | need to redirect the below questions to someone else.
Thank you!

I'd appreciate to provide clarifications on the below situations:

- 2 Projects (outputs) #s 10012 and 112162, highlighted in blue in the attachment, do not have award {project)
number in Atlas —|

Thank you. This is noted.

- 2 awards (projects} operationally closed, highlighted in orange in the attachment, that are still open. One of
them was closed for more than 12 months. —

Noted. Please, update when transfer of the balance is done.

- Award (project} 59750, including 3 outputs, with end date in December 2017 is still with “active’ status in Atlas. —

Noted. Please, update when projects are closed.

- Award (project) 60062 with end date 30 June 2018, did not have activities since 2017 and still with “active”
status in Atlas, What is the current status of the project? —

Zan vou please share the letter to the 1P?



- Award {project) 80256 with end date 31 Dec 2019, however it didn’t have any activity in 2018. What is the

current status of the project? — INIERER IR

Noted. Can you please, share the project AWP for 2019?

Award (project) 66219 with end date in June 2019 but with no activites since 2017. Update on its status.

Can you please share the detail of the remaining balance of this project?

- Award (project) 79015 ‘UNCT Workplan 2014&2015’. What will be the decision on this project after the
delinking?

Noted with thanks.
Best regards,

Olinda






